
 

FOR IMMEDIATE RELEASE 

House Of Applejay Dis�llery Opens Unique Pa�o BearBarrels, the Largest 
in Georgia, USA 

 

East Ellijay, GA – 03/14/2024 – House Of Applejay Dis�llery is excited to announce the opening of 
its one-of-a-kind outdoor tas�ng room, the Pa�o BearBarrels. These oversized barrels, made in 
Germany and featuring benches and a table, offer a unique and immersive tas�ng experience, 
making them the largest barrels in Georgia, USA. 

Located in East Ellijay, House Of Applejay Dis�llery is known for its commitment to cra�ing 
excep�onal fine spirits and liqueurs. The BearBarrels are an extension of this commitment, 
providing visitors with a memorable and enjoyable way to savor the dis�llery's offerings. 

Visitors to the BearBarrels can enjoy a range of tas�ng experiences as well as the opportunity to 
sample House Of Applejay's signature spirits and liqueurs. Whether visitors are seasoned spirits 
enthusiasts or new to the world of cra� dis�lling, the House Of Applejay offers something for 
everyone. 

"We are thrilled to open our BearBarrels and offer our guests a truly unique tas�ng experience," 
said Caroline Porsiel, CEO of House Of Applejay Dis�llery. "Our goal is to create memorable 
moments for our visitors, and we believe that the BearBarrels will do just that." 

In addi�on to the BearBarrels, House Of Applejay Dis�llery also offers tours of its dis�llery, where 
visitors can learn about the art of cra� dis�lling and see firsthand how House Of Applejay's spirits 
are made. The dis�llery also features a tas�ng room where visitors can sample a variety of spirits 
and liqueurs. 

The BearBarrels at House Of Applejay Dis�llery are now open to the public. While the tas�ng room 
and pa�o welcomes walk-ins, tours of the dis�llery must be pre-ordered. For more informa�on, 
please visit the dis�llery's website or call +1 404.771.4332. 

For more informa�on about House of Applejay, Inc. Dis�llery and its offerings, visit 
houseofapplejay.com or follow @houseofapplejay on social media. 

 

 

 



 

 

Contact: 

Caroline Porsiel  
CEO | House Of Applejay, Inc. 
info@houseofapplejay.com 

+1 404.771.4332 

 

### About House of Applejay Dis�llery 

Founded in 2022, House of Applejay Dis�llery is a cra� dis�llery specializing in fine spirits and 
liqueurs located in East Ellijay, Georgia. Recognized for its flagship product, Applejay, the dis�llery 
cra�s small-batch vodkas and liqueurs that push the boundaries of natural flavor explora�on. 
Commited to educa�on and experience, House of Applejay invites visitors to immerse themselves 
in the rich heritage of cra� dis�lla�on through history and tas�ng tours. 

 

### Follow House of Applejay Dis�llery 

- Website: www.houseofapplejay.com  

- YouTube  www.youtube.com/@houseofapplejay  

- Instagram: @houseofapplejay www.instagram.com/houseofapplejay_  

- Facebook: www.facebook.com/houseofapplejay 

- TikTok www.�ktok.com/@houseofapplejay  
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